

Position: Athletics / 164982042
 of Bid: Baseball Charter
 Bidding Date: 1/17/2022
 Contact: Tina Girdley / tgirdley@tntech.edu

Highlighted cells below indicate which item is being awarded and to whom.

Qty	Unit	Item Description	GrayLine of Tennessee		First Class Charter		Anchor Transportation	
			Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price	Unit Price	Ext. Price
1	EA	Trip 1: University of Alabama – Tuscaloosa, AL	\$ 3,955.61	\$ 3,955.61	\$ 3,200.00	\$ 3,200.00	\$ 3,795.00	\$ 3,795.00
1	EA	Trip 2: Georgia Tech – Atlanta, GA	\$ 7,303.00	\$ 7,303.00	\$ 6,400.00	\$ 6,400.00	\$ 6,012.00	\$ 6,012.00
1	EA	Trip 3: Queens University of Charlotte – Charlotte, NC	\$ 7,324.80	\$ 7,324.80	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 7,040.00	\$ 7,040.00
1	EA	Trip 4: Vanderbilt University – Nashville, TN	\$ 2,158.20	\$ 2,158.20	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 2,470.00	\$ 2,470.00
1	EA	Trip 5: Davidson College – Davidson, NC	\$ 7,848.00	\$ 7,848.00	No Bid	-	\$ 7,040.00	\$ 7,040.00
1	EA	Trip 6: Morehead State University – Morehead, KY	\$ 7,826.20	\$ 7,826.20	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 7,040.00	\$ 7,040.00
1	EA	Trip 7: Belmont University – Nashville, TN	\$ 1,698.22	\$ 1,698.22	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,470.00	\$ 2,470.00
1	EA	Trip 8: Lipscomb University – Nashville, TN	\$ 1,698.22	\$ 1,698.22	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,470.00	\$ 2,470.00
1	EA	Trip 9: Southeast Missouri – Cape Girardeau, MO	\$ 7,412.00	\$ 7,412.00	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 7,040.00	\$ 7,040.00
1	EA	Trip 10: UT Knoxville – Knoxville, TN	\$ 1,915.68	\$ 1,915.68	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 2,470.00	\$ 2,470.00
1	EA	Trip 11: Alabama A&M – Huntsville, AL	\$ 2,257.39	\$ 2,257.39	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 2,200.00	\$ 2,470.00	\$ 2,470.00
1	EA	Trip 12: Eastern Illinois University – Charleston, IL	\$ 7,739.00	\$ 7,739.00	No Bid	-	\$ 7,040.00	\$ 7,040.00
1	EA	Trip 13: University of Kentucky – Lexington, KY	\$ 2,687.12	\$ 2,687.12	No Bid	-	\$ 2,590.00	\$ 2,590.00
1	EA	Trip 14: University of Arkansas Little Rock – Little Rock, AR	\$ 7,848.00	\$ 7,848.00	No Bid	-	\$ 7,040.00	\$ 7,040.00
5	EA	TRIP 15: OVC Tournament - (Marion, Illinois)	\$ 1,853.00	\$ 9,265.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 1,760.00	\$ 8,800.00
Intent to Award Date: 1/18/2023								
Note to Bidders: If you require any additional information, please contact the Buyer listed above within seven (7) calendar days of the Intent to Award Date. After that time, additional information may be requested by contacting the TTU Associate VP of Communications at www.tntech.edu/univadv/ocm/contact-us								