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1 EA Trip 1 - Macon, GA  $     4,100.00  $     4,700.00  24 hours  $                      3,960.00  $                      4,160.00  7 days  no bid  $          4,875.00 36 hours  no bid  $       5,350.00 72 hours

1 EA Trip 2 - Spartanburg, SC  $     4,100.00  $     4,700.00  $                      3,960.00  $                      4,160.00  no bid  $          3,900.00  no bid  $       4,200.00 

1 EA Trip 3 - Johnson City, TN  $     4,100.00  $     4,700.00  $                      4,360.00  $                      4,560.00  no bid  $          3,950.00  no bid  $       5,200.00 

1 EA Trip 4 - Johnson City, TN  $     4,100.00  $     4,700.00  $                      4,360.00  no bid  no bid  $          4,100.00  no bid  $       5,900.00 

1 EA Trip 5 - Charleston, IL / Edwardsville,  $     4,195.00  $     4,480.00  $                      5,500.00  $                      5,900.00  no bid  $          4,200.00  no bid  $       5,000.00 

1 EA Trip 6 - Jacksonville, AL  $     2,475.00  $     2,630.00  $                      2,750.00  $                      2,950.00  no bid  $          3,075.00  no bid  $       2,700.00 

1 EA Trip 7 - Cape Girardeau, MO / Martin,  $     3,150.00  $     3,600.00  $                      4,125.00  no bid  no bid  $          3,075.00  no bid  $       4,500.00 

1 EA Trip 8 - Oxford, AL / OVC Tournament  $     3,325.00  $     3,665.00  $2,750 / $1,375 per day  $2,950 / $1,475 per day  2 night minimum  no bid  $1,025 - per day  no bid  $       1,575.00 

After that time, additional information about a public records request may be found  at https://www.tntech.edu/ocm/pr/public-records.php 

Premier Transportation Wise Coaches, Inc.

Note to Bidders:  If you require any additional information, please contact the Buyer listed above within seven (7) calendar days of the Intent to Award Date.   

or by contacting the TTU Associate VP of Communications at openrecords@tntech.edu.

Estes Bus Service Gray Line Tn

Department / Requisition:  Athletics / 123980039

Description of Bid: Softball Charter

Opening Date: 10/30/2019

Buyer: Tina Girdley / tgirdley@tntech.edu

Highlighted cell below indicate who is being awarded

Intent to Award Date:11/13/2019


